

FOI Answers

CCG
Date:

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements.	Name	Job title	Telephone No.	Email Address
	We do not give out names as part of FOI requests. To contact the senior officer, please email the CCG's generic email address at whccg.info@nhs.net stating the subject of your enquiry and your email will be forwarded to the appropriate senior officer.			

For questions 2 to 6, please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available for 2019/20.

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available for 2019/20.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Total in residential care	98	128	131
3. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in 'in area' placements and the number that are in 'out of area' placements. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available for 2019/20.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
In area	Data not held		
Out of area	Data not held		
4. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in supported living. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the most up to date snapshot available for 2019/20.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Total in supported living	8	no longer reported separately	
5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children's learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care services only, and into adult supported living services only. Please supply the total number that transitioned in each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the number that have transitioned to date in 2019/20.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Total transitioned	Numbers too low to report - the CCG does not provide data on patients numbers 5 and below as the data could be patient identifiable		
Transitioned to residential care			
Transitioned to supported living			
6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who 'stepped down' from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services. Please supply the total number that stepped down in each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, the number that have stepped down to date in 2019/20.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Stepped down into residential care	The cost of providing this data exceeds the 18 hours, £450 limit and therefore under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act (Requests where the cost of compliance exceeds the appropriate limit) we will not be providing this information.		
Stepped down into supported living			
7. Please provide the local authority's total expenditure on residential care and supported living for adults with learning disabilities for each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19, and where possible, budgeted expenditure for 2019/20. If expenditure for 2019/20 is not yet available, please provide projected expenditure.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Total expenditure on residential care	Refer to HCC	Refer to HCC	Refer to HCC
Total expenditure on supported living	Refer to HCC	Refer to HCC	Refer to HCC
8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the CCG for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2017/18 to 2018/19. If the Local Authority has weekly rate bands, please also provide these.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Highest weekly rate, £	£5,826	£8,005	£7,826
Lowest weekly rate, £	£1,001	£1,001	£1,005
Average weekly rate, £	£2,210	£2,700	£2,423
Weekly rate bands, £ (if used)	Don't Know	Don't Know	Don't Know
9. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the CCG for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2016/17 to 2018/19. If the Local Authority has hourly rate bands, please also provide these.	2017/18	2018/19	2019/20
Highest hourly rate, £	CONI not available	Rate Cards Not In Place	Information not available
Lowest hourly rate, £	CONI not available	Rate Cards Not In Place	Information not available
Average hourly rate, £	CONI not available	Rate Cards Not In Place	Information not available
Hourly rate bands, £ (if used)	CONI not available	Rate Cards Not In Place	Information not available